

	State of West Virginia Agency Request for Quote Chemicals
---	--

Proc Folder: 750333		Reason for Modification:	
Doc Description: Cacapon SP Golf Course Chemicals			
Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order			
Date Issued	Solicitation Closes	Solicitation No	Version
2021-02-01	2021-02-18 13:30	ARFQ 0310 DNR2100000001	1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID RESPONSE
 DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
 PROPERTY & PROCUREMENT OFFICE
 324 4TH AVE
 SOUTH CHARLESTON WV 25303-1228
 US

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: WV 02515 + 000000178080
Vendor Name: Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc.
Address: 12955 Ford Drive
Street:
City: Fishers
State: Indiana **Country:** United States **Zip:** 46038
Principal Contact: Marshall Klay
Vendor Contact Phone: 304-400-3786 **Extension:**

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
 James H Adkins
 (304) 558-3397
 jamie.h.adkins@wv.gov

Vendor Signature X *Marshall Klay* **FEIN#** 35-2152001 **DATE** 02/11/2021

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Emerald systemic fungicide or equal AGENCY 1 Acre	14.00000	UNIT	106.33	1,488.62

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	BASF		

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.1

Emerald systemic fungicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 0.49 pounds

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
2	Daconil Action non-systemic fungicide or equal	20.00000	UNIT	No bid	No bid

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.2

Daconil Action non-systemic fungicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
3	Velista systemic fungicide or equal	14.00000	UNIT	No bid	No bid

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description:
Item No. 3.1.3
Velista systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 22 ounce

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
4	Podium turf growth regulator or equal Alternate: Armortech PGR 113	4.00000	UNIT	144.00	576.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	United Turf Alliance		

Extended Description:
Item No. 3.1.4
Podium turf growth regulator or equal.
1 unit is = or > 1 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
5	Banol non-systemic fungicide or equal AGENCY	14.00000	UNIT	999.20	13,988.80

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	Bayer		

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.5

Banol non-systemic fungicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
6	Signature systemic fungicide or equal AGENCY	16.00000	UNIT	175.00	2,800.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	Bayer		

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.6

Signature systemic fungicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 5.5 pounds

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
7	Tartan systemic fungicide or equal AGENCY	3.00000	UNIT	850.00	2,550.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	Bayer		

Extended Description:
 Item No. 3.1.7
 Tartan systemic fungicide or equal.
 1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
8	Segway systemic fungicide or equal	7.00000	UNIT	415.00	2,905.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	Pfizer Gordon		

Extended Description:
 Item No. 3.1.8
 Segway systemic fungicide or equal.
 1 unit is = or > 39.2 fl. ounce

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
9	Scimitar Insecticide or equal Alternate: Triple Crown Golf AGENCY	5.00000	UNIT 1 gallon units	260.00	260.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10191500	FMC		

Extended Description:
 Item No. 3.1.9
 Scimitar insecticide or equal.
 1 unit is = or > 1 quart

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
10	Lexicon systemic fungicide or equal AGENCY	14.00000	UNIT	525.00	7,350.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	BASF		

Extended Description:
 Item No. 3.1.10
 Lexicon systemic fungicide or equal.
 1 unit is = or > 21 ounce

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
11	Sure Action systemic fungicide or equal	2.00000	UNIT	No bid	No bid

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.11

Sure Action systemic fungicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
12	Harrell's 26-1-12 fertilizer or equal Alternate: ATS 26-0-6 W/ZnB 33%AS 33%UREA 33%XCU	360.00000	UNIT	14.65	5,274.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.12

Harrell's 26-1-12 fertilizer or equal.

1 unit is = or > 50 pound

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
13	Chlorothalonil non-systemic fungicide or equal Alternate: Armortech CLT 720	34.00000	UNIT	106.60	3,624.40

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	United Turf Alliance		

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.13

Chlorothalonil non-systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
14	Tebuconazole systemic fungicide or equal Alternate: ArmortechTEB 360	7.00000	UNIT 1 gallon units	82.00	1,476.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	United Turf Alliance		

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.14

Systemic Fungicide - Tebuconazole systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
15	Chipco 26019 systemic fungicide or equal Alternate: Armortech IP 238	17.00000	UNIT	149.00	2533.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	United Turf Alliance		

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.15
Chipco 26019 systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
16	Fluazinam systemic fungicide or equal Alternate: Armortech Rotator	5.00000	UNIT	363.00	1815.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	United Turf Alliance		

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.16
Fluazinam systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 1 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
17	Subdue systemic fungicide or equal Alternate: Mefenoxam AQ	17.00000	UNIT	423.00	7,191.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	Quali-Pro		

Extended Description:
Item No. 3.1.17
Subdue systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 1 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
18	Triplet selective herbicide or equal	11.00000	UNIT	101.00	1,111.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	Nufarm		

Extended Description:
Item No. 3.1.18
Triplet selective herbicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 26411-3300 US	DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK 818 CACAPON LODGE DR BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 26411 US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
19	Spreader-Sticker adjuvant or equal Alternate: Chem Stik - 1 Gal	5.00000	UNIT	42.00	210.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600	Precision Labs		

Extended Description:
 Item No. 3.1.19
 Spreader-Sticker adjuvant or equal.
 1 unit is = or > 1 gallon

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line	Event	Event Date
1	Technical Question Deadline 9:00 AM ET	2021-02-11

	Document Phase	Document Description	Page 12
DNR210000001	Final	Cacapon SP Golf Course Chemicals	

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions.